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IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF  
MONTGOMERY COUNTY, ALABAMA 

ALVIN HOLMES, as Chairman of the Contract  ) 
Review Permanent Legislative Oversight   ) 
Committee of the Alabama Legislature; and  ) 
THE CONTRACT REVIEW PERMANENT  )  
LEGISLATIVE OVERSIGHT COMMITTEE  ) 
OF THE ALABAMA LEGISLATURE,   ) 
         ) 
        )  CIVIL ACTION NO.: CV-09______ 
 Plaintiffs,      ) 
        ) 
v.        ) 
        ) 
STATE OF ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF   ) 
FINANCE; BILL NEWTON, Acting Director   ) 
of Finance; BOB RILEY, Governor of Alabama;  ) 
PARAGON SOURCE, LLC; JANET   ) 
LAUDERDALE; and THOMAS RABURN,  ) 
        ) 
 Defendants.      ) 

PETITION FOR DECLARATORY JUDGMENT AND INJUNCTIVE RELIEF

INTRODUCTION

 The Plaintiffs bring this civil action seeking a declaratory judgment pursuant to § 6-6-223 

of the Code of Alabama and Rule 57 of Alabama Rules of Civil Procedure and injunctive relief 

pursuant to § 41-16-31 of the Code of Alabama to enjoin the Defendants from executing and 

performing any obligations under the proposed Amendment to Contract Number 010-C8010008, 

a Professional Services Agreement between the Alabama Department of Finance and Paragon 

Source, LLC (hereinafter referred to as the “Subject Contract” or the “2009 Contract”) and 

attached hereto as Exhibit 1) until such time as the Plaintiffs have had a reasonable and 

meaningful opportunity to review and comment on the Subject Contract pursuant to their 

statutory duty. Without injunctive relief, the Defendants may execute and begin to perform a 
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contract consisting of ONE HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) State funds that appears to violate 

State law and which would thus be void as a matter of law. Plaintiff Alvin Holmes, and all other 

Alabama taxpayers, will suffer immediate and irreparable injury, loss, or damage if injunctive 

relief is not granted and the Subject Contract is approved by Governor Riley. Plaintiffs also seek 

a declaratory judgment as to whether the Subject Contract violates Alabama law and is void as a 

matter of law. 

THE PARTIES

 1. Plaintiff Alvin Holmes is an adult resident of Montgomery County, Alabama. 

Alvin Holmes is a State Representative and the Chairman of the Contract Review Permanent 

Legislative Oversight Committee of the Alabama Legislature. Alvin Holmes is an Alabama 

taxpayer and has standing for this civil action pursuant to § 41-16-31 of the Code of Alabama. 

Representative Holmes brings this civil action in his representative capacity as Chairman of the 

Contract Review Permanent Legislative Oversight Committee, pursuant to §§ 29-2-40, 29-2-41, 

and 41-16-79 (Code of Alabama). 

 2. Plaintiff the Contract Review Permanent Legislative Oversight Committee 

(hereinafter “the Committee”) is a permanent legislative committee of the Alabama Legislature 

established by statute. The Committee has the statutory responsibility of reviewing contracts for 

personal or professional services with private entities or individuals to be paid out of 

appropriated funds. See §§ 29-2-40, 29-2-41, and 41-16-79 (Code of Alabama). The Committee 

is headquartered at the Alabama State House, Room 625, 11 South Union Street, Montgomery, 

Alabama. 
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 3. Defendant the State of Alabama Department of Finance (hereinafter “the 

Department” or the “Department of Finance”) is an executive and administrative department of 

the State of Alabama. The Department is a necessary party pursuant to § 6-6-223 of the Code of 

Alabama. The Department may be served at Alabama Department of Finance, Alabama State 

Capitol, 600 Dexter Avenue - Suite N-105, Montgomery, Alabama 36130. 

 4. Defendant Bill Newton is the Acting Director of the State of Alabama Department 

of Finance. Mr. Newton is the signatory on the Subject Contract on behalf of the Department. 

Mr. Newton is a necessary party pursuant to § 6-6-223 of the Code of Alabama. Mr. Newton 

may be served at Alabama Department of Finance, Alabama State Capitol, 600 Dexter Avenue - 

Suite N-105, Montgomery, Alabama 36130. 

 5. Defendant Bob Riley is the duly elected Governor of the State of Alabama. 

Governor Riley is a party to this civil action because the Subject Contract has been delivered to 

him for approval and execution. Governor Riley is a necessary party pursuant to § 6-6-223 of the 

Code of Alabama. Governor Riley may be served at the Office of the Governor, State Capitol, 

600 Dexter Avenue, Montgomery, Alabama 36130. 

 6. Defendant Paragon Source, LLC (hereinafter “Paragon”) is a business entity 

organized under the laws of the State of Virginia. Paragon is a necessary party pursuant to § 6-6-

223 of the Code of Alabama. Its principal place of business is located at 10611 Samaga Drive, 

Oakton, Virginia 22124. Upon best information and belief, Thomas J. Raburn is the managing 

and sole member of Paragon Source, LLC, however, Paragon has failed to provide a description 

of the company and its members. Paragon’s registered agent for service of process in Alabama is 

listed as Janet Lauderdale, who has been identified as the President of Paragon. However, Janet 

Lauderdale does not reside or work at, or apparently have any current connection to, the address 
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on file with the Alabama Secretary of State, which is listed as 8368 Wexford Way, Montgomery, 

Alabama 36117 (see Exhibit 4). 

 7. Upon best information and belief, Defendant Janet Lauderdale is an adult resident 

of Virginia, residing at 10611 Samaga Drive, Oakton, Virginia 22124. Janet Lauderdale is the 

President of Paragon Source, LLC and was the signatory on behalf of Paragon Source, LLC on 

the contracts that form the basis of this Complaint. Janet Lauderdale also personally performed 

work and was compensated individually through the contracts that form the basis of this 

Complaint. Janet Lauderdale is a necessary party pursuant to § 6-6-223 of the Code of Alabama. 

Janet Lauderdale does not reside at or have any apparent connection to the address on file with 

the Alabama Secretary of State for the registered agent of Paragon Source, LLC. Janet 

Lauderdale does jointly own real property in Montgomery County, Alabama with Thomas 

Raburn, and upon best information and belief, resides at least part time at 1113 Old Breckenridge 

Lane, Montgomery, Alabama 36117 (see Exhibit 5).  

 8. Upon best information and belief, Defendant Thomas Raburn is an adult resident 

of Virginia, residing at 10611 Samaga Drive, Oakton, Virginia 22124. Thomas Raburn is the 

Managing Member of Paragon Source, LLC and also personally performed some work and was 

compensated individually through the contracts that form the basis of this Complaint. Thomas 

Raburn is a necessary party pursuant to § 6-6-223 of the Code of Alabama. While a resident of 

Virginia, Thomas Raburn does own jointly real property in Montgomery County, Alabama with 

Janet Lauderdale located at 1113 Old Breckenridge Lane, Montgomery, Alabama 36117, which 

he owns (see Exhibit 5). 
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STATEMENT OF FACTS

I. Chronology of Key Events Related to the Subject Contract 

9. At some time prior to September 2009, on a date yet to be determined, Bill 

Newton on behalf of the Department of Finance and Janet Lauderdale on behalf of Paragon 

Source, LLC negotiated or otherwise reached an agreement on what has been described as a 

second amendment to a contract identified as Contract Number 010-C8010008 (the “Subject 

Contract” or “2009 Contract,” which is attached hereto as Exhibit 1). The stated 

Contract/Amendment Total is TWELVE MILLION NINE HUNDRED THOUSAND 

DOLLARS ($12,900,000.00) and was to be comprised of ONE HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) 

State funds. The stated effective date of the Subject Contract was to be October 1, 2009 and the 

ending date was to be September 30, 2012.  

a. The stated “Summary of Contract Services to be Provided” under the 2009 

Contract was “Advice and assistance with Business Process Reengineering efforts and 

development of project plans and provide subject matter expertise to support SMART 

Business Systems, an ERP project intended to encompass financial, procurement, 

personnel, and payroll functions and in support to the State’s reporting requirements 

under the American Recovery and Reinvestment Act of 2009 (ARRA)” (Exhibit 1 at p. 

1).  

b. The “original” contract, also referred to herein as the 2007 Contract, 

between the Department of Finance and Paragon went into effect on October 1, 2007 and 

was to terminate on September 30, 2009, with a stated value of $1,450,000.00 and 

comprised of 100% State funds (the 2007 Contract is attached hereto as Exhibit 2). The 

stated “Summary of Contracts Services to be Provided” under the 2007 contract was: 
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“Consulting, Documentation and Design related to Finance, HR and Procurement 

projects” (Exhibit 2 at p. 1). The 2007 Contract was not competitively bid and the 

Department of Finance did not issue a Request for Proposals for such a contract for 

services, as is customary procedure for State contracts. 

c. The 2007 Contract was “amended” in 2008, increasing the value of the 

contract to FIVE MILLION NINE HUNDRED FIFTY-NINE THOUSAND DOLLARS 

($5,959,000.00) and covering the same time frame as the “original” 2007 Contract (this 

contract “amendment” is attached hereto as Exhibit 3 and is hereinafter referred to as the 

“2008 Contract”). The stated “Summary of Contract Services to be Provided” under the 

2008 Contract was: “Advice and assistance with Business Process Reengineering efforts 

and development of strategies and a data-mart to support SMART Business Systems, an 

ERP project intended to encompass financial, procurement, personnel, and payroll 

functions” (Exhibit 3 at p. 1).  

d. The 2007 Contract and the 2009 Contract each contain the following 

provision: “Contractor has represented to Finance that its personnel have unique and 

specialized knowledge of systems and processes of Finance and that by their knowledge, 

training and experience, they are uniquely qualified to perform the Work” (see Exhibit 2 

at p. 2, § 3; and Exhibit 1 at p. 2, § 3A). The 2008 Contract contained a slightly different 

worded version of the same provision: “Contractor has represented to Finance that its 

personnel have unique and specialized knowledge of systems and business processes and 

that by their knowledge, training and experience, they are uniquely qualified to perform 

the Work” (see Exhibit 3 at p. 6, § 3A). None of the contracts, nor any of the 

documentation provided to the Committee, contain any documentation of exactly what 
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Paragon’s “unique and specialized knowledge” really was, and the Department of 

Finance has not provided the Committee with any documentation of anything the 

Department did to verify or confirm such “unique and specialized knowledge” so as to 

justify the sole source determination and resulting no-bid contracts. 

10. On or about September 4, 2009, the Committee received the proposed contract 

between Paragon Source, LLC and the Department of Finance, which was submitted to the 

Committee for review as required by and pursuant to § 29-2-41 of the Code of Alabama. Said 

contract purported to be an amendment to a contract identified as Contract Number 010-

C8010008. The stated Contract/Amendment Total is TWELVE MILLION NINE HUNDRED 

THOUSAND DOLLARS ($12,900,000.00) and was to be comprised of ONE HUNDRED 

PERCENT (100%) State funds.  

11. On or about September 15, 2009, Chairman Holmes issued a memorandum to Bill 

Newton requesting certain information from the Department of Finance about the 2007 and 2008 

Contracts. 

12. On or about September 25, 2009, Bill Newton issued a written response to 

Chairman Holmes September 15, 2009 request for information, stating specifically in part as 

follows: 

A. That no individual was paid under the Subject Contract;  

B. The address of each individual paid under the Subject Contract is 
information not available to the State; 

C. That they have no record of the specific job assignments of each Paragon 
sub-contractor or agent;  

D. That the Department found absolutely no problems with the Subject 
Contract or its negotiation. 
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13. On or about September 28, 2009, Chairman Holmes issued a memorandum to 

Janet Lauderdale and Paragon Source, LLC requesting certain information from them regarding 

the Subject Contract. 

14. On or about October 7, 2009, counsel for Janet Lauderdale and Paragon 

responded to Chairman Holmes request for information regarding the Subject Contract, stating 

specifically in part as follows: 

A. “Because of her knowledge and the high quality of her work, the State 
brought Ms. Lauderdale back to assist with the legislatively-mandated 
conversion of paying State employees from biweekly arrears to semi-
monthly arrears” (Exhibit 6, at p. 1). 

B. “We want to emphasize that the State of Alabama initiated discussions 
regarding working again with Ms. Lauderdale, not vice versa” (Exhibit 6, 
at p. 1). 

C. “The requests seeks proprietary information” (Exhibit 6, at p. 2). 

D. “The means and methods of performing the contract is entirely within the 
discretion of Paragon” (Exhibit 6, at p. 2). 

E. “Paragon does not have payroll information regarding most of the 
individuals identified on Exhibit ‘A’ [a list of individuals who worked on 
Paragon Source, LLC’s prior contract] because they are not employees of 
Paragon. Paragon is the party responsible for the performance of the 
contract and Paragon enters into agreements (subcontracts) with entities 
… as well as a few individuals, to acquire highly qualified personnel to 
provide specific, specialized support to comply with its agreement terms” 
(Exhibit 6, at p. 3).1

F. “The subcontractors are private entities or individuals and Paragon is not 
privy to the agreement between the entity and individual performing work 
on the contract. Paragon does not have and has not had a contract on any 
of its Alabama agreements that either does not or did not relate directly to 
work to be performed under the contract” (Exhibit 6, at p. 3). 

                                                
1 Each of the 2007, 2008, and 2009 Contracts contained the following provision: “Neither party may assign this 
Agreement or delegate any duties hereunder without the prior written consent of the other party.” See Exhibit 2 at p. 
4, § 12; Exhibit 3 at p. 8, § 12; and Exhibit 1 at p. 4, § 12. To date, no such documentation of written consent for 
Paragon to delegate its duties under the contracts has been produced. 
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G. “Paragon considers the terms of its agreements with its subcontractors and 
its employees, including compensation, to be proprietary” (Exhibit 6, at p. 
3). 

H. When asked to describe the nature of work performed by each individual 
under the Contract, Paragon responded: “Paragon considers its means and 
methods of performing its agreements with the State to be within its sole 
discretion and proprietary” (Exhibit 6, at p. 3). 

15. On or about October 7, 2009, the Committee, unsatisfied with the responses to 

Chairman Holmes’ requests for information to the Department of Finance and to Paragon,  

issued a subpoena to Janet Lauderdale of Paragon Source, LLC commanding production of 

certain information regarding Paragon’s performance under any contracts between Paragon 

Source, LLC and the Department of Finance since September 2007 (see Exhibit 7, Subpoena to 

Janet Lauderdale). 

16. On or about October 7, 2009, the Committee, unsatisfied with the responses to 

Chairman Holmes’ requests for information to the Department of Finance and to Paragon, issued 

a subpoena to Bill Newton, Acting Director the Department of Finance, commanding production 

of certain information regarding Paragon’s performance under any contracts between Paragon 

Source, LLC and the Department of Finance since September 2007 (see Exhibit 8, Subpoena to 

the Department of Finance). 

17. On or about October 9, 2009, the Department of Finance responded to the 

subpoena stating specifically in part as follows: 

A. The Department is “unable … to provide the Committee with information 
that the Finance Department simply does not possess regarding home 
addresses” (Exhibit 9, at p. 1). 

B. “[T]he Committee has requested documents that the Finance Department 
does not have and never had” (Exhibit 9, at p. 1) (emphasis in original). 
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18. On or about October 14, 2009, Janet Lauderdale and Paragon Source, LLC, 

through their attorney, responded to the subpoena, producing several thousand pages of 

documents, most of which were non-responsive to the Committee’s subpoena. Paragon failed to 

comply with the terms of the subpoena in multiple respects, including: 

a. Failing to provide the full names of most of the individuals who had been paid 
under the contracts since September 2007, instead providing only last names and 
first initials;  

b. Failing to provide the addresses of most of the individuals identified as having 
been paid under the contracts since September 2007; and 

c. Failing to provide a meaning and accurate description of the nature of the work 
performed by each individual or subcontractor working under the contracts since 
September 2007. 

(See Exhibit 10). 

19. On or about October 19, 2009, Chairman Holmes delivered the Subject Contract 

to Governor Riley and advised him of the Committee’s serious concerns with the Subject 

Contract and the numerous unresolved issues related to it and the work performed to date by 

Paragon under its contracts with the Department of Finance. Because of these serious concerns, 

Chairman Holmes requested that Governor Riley not approve and sign the Subject Contract. 

II. Other Significant Facts In Support of Injunctive Relief 

A. Issues Related to Paragon Source, LLC 

20. Since September 2007, the State of Alabama has paid Paragon FIVE MILLION 

SIX HUNDRED SEVENTY-SIX THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED AND FIVE DOLLARS 

($5,676,805.00) under one or more no-bid contracts with the Department of Finance. 

21. Upon best information and belief, during the times relevant to its performance of 

work under contracts with the Department of Finance and at the time of its proposal to perform 
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additional work under the Subject Contract, Paragon Source, LLC was a business entity 

operating out of a residential address in Oakton, Virginia and employing no more than two (2) 

employees. The contracted work was actually being performed or proposed to be performed by 

other individual and entities with which Paragon subcontracted.  

22. Despite a request from the Committee, Paragon has refused to produce copies of 

the subcontracts that it has entered into with various individual and entities to perform the work 

under its contracts with the Department of Finance. 

23. According to Alabama Secretary of State records, Paragon Source, LLC did not 

qualify to do business in Alabama until April 13, 2006. However, Paragon was doing work and 

soliciting additional work in Alabama prior to that time under a contract that began in 2005. 

Therefore, Paragon Source, LLC was performing work in Alabama, for the Department of 

Finance, at least one year prior to bothering to register with the Secretary of State to qualify to do 

business in Alabama (see Exhibit 11, a June 21, 2005 memorandum regarding a contract with 

Paragon Source, LLC in effect at that time). That is just one example of the blatant failures of 

Paragon to respect and comply with the laws of Alabama as they relate to doing business in and 

with the State of Alabama. That is also an example of the Department of Finance either failing to 

ensure that Paragon was qualified to do business in Alabama or blatantly ignoring that fact that 

Paragon was willfully failing to comply with the laws of the State of Alabama. 

24. In response to the Committee’s request to Paragon for information regarding the 

contract work, counsel for Paragon stated that “[w]e want to reemphasize that the State of 

Alabama initiated discussions regarding working again with Ms. Lauderdale, not vice versa” (see 

Exhibit 6 at p. 1). However, by letter dated April 28, 2006, and by email dated May 24, 2006, 
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Janet Lauderdale on behalf of Paragon Source, LLC clearly was proposing and soliciting 

additional work from the State (see Exhibit 12) rather than the other way around. 

B. Issues Related to Other Individuals and Entities Paid Through the Contract 

25. In response to the Committee’s subpoena, the attorney for Janet Lauderdale and 

Paragon Source, LLC identified the following individuals and entities as those individuals or 

subcontractors paid by Paragon under the contract between the Department of Finance and 

Paragon since September 2007, and provided the listed compensation amounts for that time 

period2 (see Exhibit 10): 

 (1) Castleberry Consulting Group, LLC
  433 Prosper Circle 
  Marietta, Georgia 30060 
  Amount: $668,367.50 

a. Castleberry Consulting Group, LLC is organized under the 
laws of Georgia, and as of October 1, 2009, was not 
registered or qualified to do business in Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Castleberry 
Consulting Group, LLC has complied with any of the other 
laws applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama 
or in the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was 
to be performed. 

 (2) Janet Lauderdale
  10611 Samaga Drive 
  Oakton, Virginia 22124 
  Amount: $596,780.00 

a. Plaintiffs cannot determine if this amount stated includes 
all compensation Janet Lauderdale received for that time 
period for work on the Department of Finance contracts. 

b. Defendants have not disclosed and Plaintiffs have not been 
able to determine if Janet Lauderdale is a member of 
Paragon Source, LLC with an ownership interest or if she is 
just an officer/employee of Paragon Source, LLC with no 
ownership interest.  

c. If Janet Lauderdale does have an ownership interest in 
Paragon Source, LLC, this raises additional questions as to 

                                                
2 Plaintiffs are still reviewing and trying to verify and reconcile these figures, although it appears that Paragon failed 
to provide all of the requested information for that time period. 
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the total compensation that she has received as a result of 
the Department of Finance contracts for the stated time 
period. 

d. Upon best information and belief, neither Paragon nor Janet 
Lauderdale, at all relevant times, did not obtain or possess a 
license to do business in the City of Montgomery, 
Alabama, where the contract work was to be performed, in 
violation of the laws of the City of Montgomery. It is 
unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Janet Lauderdale 
has complied with any of the other laws applicable to doing 
business in the State of Alabama or in the City of 
Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

 (3) Alcala Change Consulting
  1902 Abbey Court 
  Alpharetta, Georgia 30004 
  Amount: $569,890.00 

a. Alcala Change Consulting is organized under the laws of 
Georgia, and as of October 1, 2009, was not registered or 
qualified to do business in Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Alcala Change 
Consulting has complied with any of the other laws 
applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama or in 
the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

 (4) Upspire Consulting, LLC
  8422 Sea Ash Circle 
  Round Rock, Texas 78681 
  Amount: $516,070.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Upspire Consulting, LLC 
is organized under the laws of Texas, and as of October 1, 
2009, was not registered or qualified to do business in 
Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Upspire 
Consulting, LLC has complied with any of the other laws 
applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama or in 
the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

 (5) Value Enhanced Technology Services, Inc. (“VETS”) 
  Post Office Box 2319   
  Huntsville, Alabama 35802 
  Amount: $398,275.00 
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a. Although this purports to be an Alabama-based business, 
Plaintiffs have not been able to locate any record of this 
business, under either its full name or its acronym, being 
incorporated in Alabama or qualified to do business in 
Alabama as of October 1, 2009, or where it is legally 
domiciled, if anywhere. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Value 
Enhanced Technology Services, Inc. has complied with any 
of the other laws applicable to doing business in the State 
of Alabama or in the City of Montgomery, where the 
contract work was to be performed. 

c. Interestingly and perhaps coincidently, Chairman and CEO 
Phillip Williams formerly served as the Alabama Finance 
Director from 1995-96, according to VETS’ website. 

   (6) Concerus, LLC
    1509 Bellaire Drive 
    Austin, Texas 78741 
    Amount: $389,056.45 

a. Upon best information and belief, Concerus, LLC is 
organized under the laws of Texas, and as of October 1, 
2009, was not registered or qualified to do business in 
Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Concerus, LLC 
has complied with any of the other laws applicable to doing 
business in the State of Alabama or in the City of 
Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

   (7) Peyton McCall, Inc.
    7504 Alaska Avenue, NW 
    Washington, DC 20012 
    Amount: $382,245.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Peyton McCall, Inc., as 
of October 1, 2009, was not registered or qualified to do 
business in Alabama, and also apparently is not registered 
or qualified to do business in the District of Columbia, 
where it is headquartered, either. It is unknown to Plaintiffs 
what jurisdiction Peyton McCall, Inc. is actually domiciled 
in. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Peyton McCall, 
Inc. has complied with any of the other laws applicable to 
doing business in the State of Alabama or in the City of 
Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 
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   (8) 21st Capital Corp.
    File 70163 [???] 
    Los Angeles, California 90074-0163  
    Amount: $298,809.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, 21st Capital Corp. is 
organized under the laws of California, has its principal 
place of business in Malibu, California, and as of October 
1, 2009, was not registered or qualified to do business in 
Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if 21st Capital 
Corp., Inc. has complied with any of the other laws 
applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama or in 
the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

c. According to its website, 21st Capital Corp. is a payroll 
funding company, although the nature of the work it 
allegedly performed under the 2007 and 2008 Contracts is 
currently unknown to the Plaintiffs. 

d. The address provided by Paragon does not appear to be an 
actual address. 

   (9) Pam Misrocchi
    1030 Martin Ridge Road 
    Roswell, Georgia 30076 
    Amount: $248,640.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Pam Misrocchi is a 
resident of the State of Georgia, and it is unknown to the 
Plaintiffs at this time if Pam Misrocchi was, at relevant 
times, acting as an independent contractor of Paragon or of 
any other entity. 

b. The nature of the work performed by Pam Misrocchi is 
unknown to Plaintiffs at this time and still needs to be 
determined. 

c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Pam Misrocchi 
performed the work for which she was compensated on site 
in Montgomery, Alabama, as called for in the 2007 and 
2008 Contracts, or if she performed the work off-site from 
her office or residence in Georgia. 

d. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Pam Misrocchi 
has complied with all laws applicable to doing business in 
the State of Alabama of in the City of Montgomery, where 
the contract work was to be performed. 

     
   (10) Thomas Nola
    3804 Warehill Drive 
    Montgomery, Alabama 36109 
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    Amount: $194,365.00 
a. Upon best information and belief, Thomas Nola is a 

resident of the State of Alabama, and it is unknown to the 
Plaintiffs at this time if Thomas Nola was, at relevant 
times, acting as an independent contractor of Paragon or of 
any other entity. 

b. The nature of the work performed by Thomas Nola is 
unknown to Plaintiffs at this time and still needs to be 
determined. 

c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Thomas Nola 
has complied with all laws applicable to doing business in 
the State of Alabama of in the City of Montgomery. 

   (11) Slade Kennedy
    340 Broken Lance Place 
    Alpharetta, Georgia 30022 
    Amount: $151,730.00 

a. This apparently is a Georgia-based entity although there are 
2 entities with that name and it is unclear if they are 
referring to: (1) Slade Kennedy Executive Search, LLC,
or (2) Slade Kennedy Construction, LLC, as both entities 
are located at the same address and Jonathan Rucks is the 
principal of both entities 

b. As of October 1, 2009, neither of those entities was 
registered or qualified to do business in Alabama, and 
Slade Kennedy Executive Search, LLC currently has a 
status of “Active/Noncompliance” with the Georgia 
Secretary of State. 

c. Despite being paid by Paragon through “Slade Kennedy,” 
Jonathan Rucks also billed Paragon for work through 
Alcala Change Consulting, although Rucks’ connection to 
Alcala Change Consulting is unknown to Plaintiffs at this 
time and still needs to be determined. 

c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if “Salde 
Kennedy” has complied with any of the other laws 
applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama or in 
the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

   (12) Lisa Rakes
    Post Office Box 1897 
    Buford, Georgia 30515 
    Amount: $142,100.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Lisa Rakes is a resident 
of the State of Georgia, and it is unknown to the Plaintiffs 
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at this time if Lisa Rakes was, at relevant times, acting as 
an independent contractor of Paragon or of any other entity. 

b. The nature of the work performed by Lisa Rakes is 
unknown to Plaintiffs at this time and still needs to be 
determined. 

c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Lisa Rakes 
performed the work for which she was compensated on site 
in Montgomery, Alabama, as called for in the 2007 and 
2008 Contracts, or if she performed the work off-site from 
her office or residence in Georgia. 

d. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Lisa Rakes has 
complied with all laws applicable to doing business in the 
State of Alabama of in the City of Montgomery, where the 
contract work was to be performed. 

   (13) Cleary Consulting
    3066 Zelda Road 
    Montgomery, Alabama 36106   
    Amount: $116,270.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Cleary Consulting is an 
unorganized business entity located in Montgomery, 
Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Cleary 
Consulting has complied with all laws applicable to doing 
business in the State of Alabama or in the City of 
Montgomery, where the contract work was to be performed 

   (14) James W. Tucker, Jr.
    6921 Cherry Creek Drive 
    Montgomery, Alabama 36117 
    Amount: $64,620.00  

a. Upon best information and belief, James W. Tucker, Jr. is a 
resident of the State of Alabama, and it is unknown to the 
Plaintiffs at this time if James W. Tucker, Jr. was, at 
relevant times, acting as an independent contractor of 
Paragon or of any other entity. 

b. The nature of the work performed by James W. Tucker, Jr.
is unknown to Plaintiffs at this time and still needs to be 
determined. 

c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if James W. 
Tucker, Jr. has complied with all laws applicable to doing 
business in the State of Alabama of in the City of 
Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

   (15) Sandra M. Porter
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    4313 Balboa Road 
    Montgomery, Alabama 36109 
    Amount: $54,976.25 

a. Upon best information and belief, Sandra M. Porter is a 
resident of the State of Alabama, and it is unknown to the 
Plaintiffs at this time if Sandra M. Porter was, at relevant 
times, acting as an independent contractor of Paragon or of 
any other entity. 

b. The nature of the work performed by Sandra M. Porter is 
unknown to Plaintiffs at this time and still needs to be 
determined. 

c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Sandra M. 
Porter has complied with all laws applicable to doing 
business in the State of Alabama of in the City of 
Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

   (16) Auburn University Montgomery
    Contracts & Grants Accounting 
    Post Office Box 244023  
    Montgomery, Alabama 36124-4023 
    Amount: $53,712.50 

a. Plaintiffs have been unable to determine what this payment 
was for or which contract it related to, as Paragon 
contracted with AUM for work performed in 2005 and 
2006.

b. For reasons that are unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time, 
Jonathan B. Moore, one of two principals who own Moore 
Consulting, LLC, was paid for contract work through 
Auburn University Montgomery in additional to being paid 
through Moore Consulting, LLC.

   (17) Periscope Holdings, Inc.
    211 East 7th Street, Suite 1100 
    Austin, Texas 78701  
    Amount: $46,725.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Periscope Holdings, Inc.
is organized under the laws of Texas, and as of October 1, 
2009, was not registered or qualified to do business in 
Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Periscope 
Holdings, Inc. has complied with any of the other laws 
applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama or in 
the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 
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   (18) Thomas Raburn
    10611 Samaga Drive 
    Oakton, Virginia 22124  
    Amount: $20,960.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Thomas Raburn is the 
managing, or possibly sole, member of Paragon Source, 
LLC.    

b. Upon best information and belief, Thomas Raburn is 
currently or formerly married to Janet Lauderdale. 

c. The address provided for Thomas Raburn is the same 
residential address in Virginia used by Paragon Source, 
LLC as its principal place of business and also used by 
Janet Lauderdale as her residential address. 

d. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Thomas 
Raburn has complied with all laws applicable to doing 
business in the State of Alabama of in the City of 
Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

   
   (19) Elite Consultants of Texas, Inc.
    10223 Broadway, Suite P246 
    Pearland, Texas 77584 
    Amount: $10,440.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Elite Consultants of 
Texas, Inc. is organized under the laws of Texas, and as of 
October 1, 2009, was not registered or qualified to do 
business in Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Elite 
Consultants of Texas, Inc. has complied with any of the 
other laws applicable to doing business in the State of 
Alabama or in the City of Montgomery, where the contract 
work was to be performed. 

   (20) Jennifer Varley
    1039 N. Winnetka Avenue 
    Dallas, Texas 75208 
    Amount: $7,125.00 

a. Upon best information and belief, Jennifer Varley is a 
resident of the State of Texas, and it is unknown to the 
Plaintiffs at this time if Jennifer Varley was, at relevant 
times, acting as an independent contractor of Paragon or of 
any other entity. 

b. The nature of the work performed by Jennifer Varley is 
unknown to Plaintiffs at this time and still needs to be 
determined. 
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c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time whether Jennifer 
Varley performed the contract work on site in 
Montgomery, Alabama, as provided for in the contract, or 
if she performed the work from her office or residence in 
Texas. 

d. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Jennifer Varley
has complied with all laws applicable to doing business in 
the State of Alabama of in the City of Montgomery, where 
the contract work was to be performed. 

   (21) Elaine C. Berry, Inc.
    100 Bannister Lane 
    Ball Ground, Georgia 30107 
    Amount: $5,843.75 

a. Elaine C. Berry, Inc. is organized under the laws of 
Georgia, and as of October 1, 2009, was not registered or 
qualified to do business in Alabama. 

b. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Elaine C. 
Berry, Inc. has complied with any of the other laws 
applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama or in 
the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

   (22) Moore Consulting, LLC
    2361 Promenade Boulevard #4 
    Montgomery, Alabama 36106 
    Amount: $3,600.00 

a. Moore Consulting, LLC is organized under the laws of 
Alabama, having been formed only on July 29, 2009 for the 
stated purpose to provide “private government consulting 
services.” 

b. It is unknown to Plaintiffs at this time whether the work 
performed by Moore Consulting, LLC was done after the 
entity came into legal existence or prior to that time, as the 
compensation information provided is for the time period 
of September 2007 through September 2009, and Moore 
Consulting, LLC was only in legal existence for the last 
two months of that time period.  

c. It is unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time if Moore 
Consulting, LLC has complied with any of the other laws 
applicable to doing business in the State of Alabama or in 
the City of Montgomery, where the contract work was to be 
performed. 

d. For reasons that are unknown to the Plaintiffs at this time, 
Jonathan B. Moore, one of two principals who own Moore 
Consulting, LLC, was paid for contract work through 
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Moore Consulting, LLC and Auburn University 
Montgomery, and the nature of his relationship to Auburn 
University Montgomery is also unknown to the Plaintiffs at 
this time.  

COUNT I – DECLARATORY JUDGMENT AND INJUNCTIVE RELIEF

26. The Plaintiffs incorporate by reference all of the allegations of preceding 

paragraphs of this complaint as if the same were set out fully herein.  

27. The Plaintiffs bring this action seeking 1) a declaratory judgment that the Subject 

Contract violates Alabama law and is void as matter of law, 2) preliminary injunctive relief while 

the Plaintiffs continue to review and investigate the Subject Contract and related documents, and 

3) permanent injunctive relief if this Honorable Court finds that the Subject Contract violates 

applicable Alabama law and is therefore void as a matter of law. Plaintiff Alvin Holmes, and all 

other Alabama taxpayers, will suffer immediate and irreparable injury, loss, or damage if 

injunctive relief is not granted and the Subject Contract is approved by Governor Riley. 

I. The Plaintiffs Have Not Had A Meaningful Opportunity to Properly Review and 
Comment On The Subject Contract and the Documentation Produced to the 
Committee Raises More Questions than Answers 

28. The Plaintiffs have requested certain information from the Department of Finance 

and Paragon so that the Committee can accurately and faithfully perform its statutorily defined 

duty to review and comment on the Subject Contract. See §§ 29-2-41 and 41-16-79 of the Code 

of Alabama. The information produced to date by the Department of Finance and Paragon has 

raised more questions than answers. Additionally, necessary information has been withheld from 

the Committee. For example, Paragon refuses to produce any of the subcontracts it has entered 

into with individuals and entities to perform the work under the Subject Contract or the original 

contract (2007 Contract) or first amendment to the original contract (2008 Contract). According 
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to counsel for Paragon, “Paragon considers the terms of its agreements with its subcontractors 

and its employees, including compensation, to be proprietary” (see Exhibit 6). 

29. Based on the information provided to the Committee to date, Paragon’s role 

appears to be more accurately characterized as a broker rather than a professional service 

provider, since Paragon did not perform, and apparently did not, and does not, have the capacity 

to perform3 the contracted for services within its own organization. Rather, Paragon brokers and 

farms out the contracted-for work to a variety of subcontractors. Very little information is known 

or available about of the subcontractors except that many of them were not qualified to do 

business in Alabama. The Subject Contract and the prior contracts awarded to Paragon since 

2007 clearly state that “[n]either party may assign this Agreement or delegate any duties 

hereunder without the prior written consent of the other party” (see Exhibit 1 at p. 4, ¶ 12). 

Neither the Department of Finance nor Paragon has provided the Committee with any 

documentation of such prior written consent for Paragon to delegate its duties to the various 

individuals and entities to which it subcontracted the work. 

30. The 2007, 2008, and 2009 Contracts are in marked contrast to earlier contracts 

that Paragon had with the State of Alabama. For example, the 20054 “Professional Services 

Agreement” between Paragon Source, LLC and the Information Services Division (ISD) of the 

Department of Finance of the State of Alabama contains the following two clause that are not 

contained in any of the 2007, 2008, or 2009 Contracts: 1) “ISD understands and agrees that 

Paragon may subcontract with third parties to perform some of the services” (Exhibit 13, at 

§3.2); and 2) “Paragon may subcontract portions of work to be performed by it under the 

                                                
3 The information available to the Plaintiffs indicates that Paragon Source, LLC actually only has or had at relevant 
times no more than two (2) employees, including Janet Lauderdale. 
4 The 2005 contract between Paragon Source, LLC and the Department of Finance was executed and performed 
prior to Paragon Source, LLC qualifying to do business in Alabama on April 13, 2006. 
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Contract provided that the subcontractors acknowledge and agree in writing to perform such 

services consistent with any applicable terms of this Agreement” ((Exhibit 13, at § 6.2). The 

2007, 2008, and 2009 Contracts do not contain either of those, or similar, clauses permitting 

subcontracting. 

31. The information provided to the Committee clearly demonstrates that the work 

“performed” by Paragon under its contract(s) with the Department of Finance since September 

2007 was actually performed by various individuals and entities that: 

a. did not bother to qualify to conduct business in Alabama5; 

b. did not obtain licenses to conduct business within the municipal limits of 

the City of Montgomery, Alabama despite the fact that the contracts 

stipulated that the work was to be performed there; 

c. upon best information and belief, have not complied with applicable tax 

laws of the State of Alabama; 

d. performed work that Paragon billed the State under one or more of at least 

forty-four (44) different job classifications with varying compensation 

rates, none of which are defined anywhere is the subject or prior contracts 

or supporting documentation; 

(1) The 2007 Contract had only seven (7) different job classifications 

with varying compensation rates, none of which are defined 

anywhere in the contract or supporting documentation (Exhibit 2 at 

p.14), 

                                                
5According to the documentation provided to the Committee, since September 2007, Paragon Source, LLC has 
received $5,676,805.00 from the State of Alabama for its “professional services” and paid out $3,437,451.60 to 
entities it subcontracted with that were not registered or qualified to do business in Alabama at the time the work 
was allegedly performed. 
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(2) The 2008 Contract increased to eighteen (18) different job 

classifications with varying compensation rates, again, none of 

which are defined anywhere in the contract or supporting 

documentation (Exhibit 3 at pp.16-17), and 

e. failed to accurately and meaningfully document the work that was 

performed. 

32. The Plaintiffs have serious concerns regarding the apparent failures of Paragon 

and the individuals and entities that it subcontracted with to comply with various requirements of 

Alabama law, despite the fact that Alabama law clearly requires that “[a]ll persons or business 

entities doing business with the State of Alabama are presumed to understand all laws and 

regulations governing the purchase of goods and services by the State of Alabama.” § 41-16-

77(b). The numerous instances where Paragon and the individuals and entities with which it 

subcontracted with have failed to understand and comply with all applicable laws and regulations 

which apply to the work performed under contracts with the Department of Finance to date is a 

very serious issue that the Committee needs to look into further before the Subject Contract goes 

into effect. 

33. At least FIVE MILLION SIX HUNDRED SEVENTY-SIX THOUSAND EIGHT 

HUNDRED AND FIVE DOLLARS ($5,676,805.00) of State funds have already been paid out 

to Paragon since September 2007 for work allegedly performed under no-bid contracts. The vast 

majority of that work was apparently performed not by Paragon, but rather by other individuals 

and entities under a series of secret, no-bid contracts between Paragon and those entities Because 

sufficient information regarding the Subject Contract and its appurtenant subcontracts has not 

been made available to the Committee, the Plaintiffs have numerous unresolved issues with the 
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Subject Contract that need to be addressed before the State commits to paying TWELVE 

MILLION NINE HUNDRED THOUSAND DOLLARS ($12,900,000.00) of State funds under 

the latest no-bid contract between the Department of Finance and Paragon. 

II. There Are Serious Public Policy Issues And Concerns With Respect To The Subject 
Contract That Need To Be Resolved If And Before The Subject Contract Is 
Finalized 

A. Upon best information and belief, the subject contact violates Alabama’s 
Competitive Bid Law and is Void as a matter of law. 

  
 34. Section 41-16-20 of the Code of Alabama requires that “all contracts of 

whatever nature for labor, services, work, or for the purchase or lease of materials, equipment, 

supplies, other personal property or other nonprofessional services, involving seven thousand 

five hundred dollars ($7,500) or more, made by or on behalf of any state department, board, 

bureau, commission, committee, institution, corporation, authority, or office shall, except as 

otherwise provided in this article, be let by free and open competitive bidding, on sealed 

bids, to the lowest responsible bidder” (emphasis added). If this contract was entered into in 

violation of Alabama’s Competitive Bid Law, the contract is void as a matter of law. See § 41-

16-21(c) (“Contracts entered into in violation of this article shall be void”) and § 41-14-77(b) 

(“Any contract entered into in violation of the provisions of this article shall be void”).  

 35. The Subject Contract purports to be a contract for professional services. 

Section 41-16-77 of the Code of Alabama provides that: 

   (3) Professional services of architects, landscape architects, 
engineers, land surveyors, geoscience, and other similar professionals 
shall be procured in accordance with competitive, qualification-based 
selection policies and procedures. Selection shall be based on factors 
to be developed by the procuring state entity which may include, 
among others, the following: 
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      a. Specialized expertise, capabilities, and technical competence, as 
demonstrated by the proposed approach and methodology to meet project 
requirements. 

      b. Resources available to perform the work, including any 
specialized services within the specified time limits for the project. 

      c. Record of past performance, quality of work, ability to meet 
schedules, cost control, and contract administration. 

      d. Availability to and familiarity with the project locale. 

      e. Proposed project management techniques. 

      f. Ability and proven history in handling special project contracts. 

 (emphasis added). The Plaintiffs are not satisfied that the Defendants have complied with 

or even considered the requirements of § 41-16-77 in awarding the latest no-bid contract 

to Paragon, or that the Defendants complied with or even considered the requirements of 

§ 41-16-77 when awarding the earlier non-bid contracts to Paragon and its secret 

subcontractors. 

 36. It is undisputed that the Subject Contract was not competitively bid. Bill 

Newton and the Department of Finance have advised the Plaintiffs that “Paragon Source, LLC is 

a sole source provider and thus bidding was not required.” (See the “Governor’s Additional 

Contract Questions Form,” Exhibit 1 at p.16). “Sole source” is defined as “[t]he provision of 

goods or a service where only one person or business entity can provide the required goods or 

service” § 41-16-71(3). Alabama law regarding a sole-source contract provides that: 

State entities seeking to purchase goods or services from a sole 
source vendor may do so only upon the approval of the 
Department of Finance, through the Division of Purchasing, unless 
the purchasing state entity is authorized by law to conduct its own 
purchasing activities. Approval for sole source purchases shall be 
given only if the purchasing state entity establishes that no other 
goods or service can meet its needs and that no other vendor offers 
substantially equivalent goods or service that can accomplish the 
purpose for which the goods or service is required. The Director of 
Finance may require information from either the purchasing entity 



27

or the vendor seeking to be declared a sole source that is deemed 
necessary to meet the requirements of this provision.  

  
§ 41-16-75 of the Code of Alabama. According to Bill Newton, “[t]he Smart Business 

Systems Steering Committee originally determined that Paragon Source, LLC is a sole 

source provider and thus bidding the contract was not required” (See Exhibit 1 at p.16, ¶ 

1) and/or “[t]he original sole source determination was made by Robert L. Childree, then 

State Comptroller based on Paragon’s experience with the State and his knowledge of the 

expertise possessed by Paragon’s consultants, this is an extension of that first agreement.” 

(See Exhibit 1 at p.16, ¶ 2). Thus, Bill Newton and the Department of Finance, in the 

same document, gave two different answers as to who made the sole-source 

determination regarding Paragon.  

 37. It is important to note that the Defendants have failed to provide the Plaintiffs 

with any documentation of how either (or both) the Smart Business Systems Steering Committee 

or Robert L. Childree made the sole-source determination and what factors were considered, if 

any. While “[t]he Director of Finance may require information from either the purchasing entity 

or the vendor seeking to be declared a sole source that is deemed necessary to meet the 

requirements of this provision,” (§ 41-16-75), the Defendants have not produced any 

documentation that Bill Newton, as acting Director of Finance, required any information from 

either the purchasing entity, the Department of Finance, or the vendor, Paragon, necessary to 

satisfy the requirements of making the sole-source determination. 

 38. It is also important to note that the Subject Contract, which purports to be a 

second amendment to a contract between the Department of Finance and Paragon, appears to 

actually be a contract for new or additional and different services, and nothing more than a way 

for the Defendants to circumvent the competitive bid law for at least the third time during the 



28

contractual relationship between the Department of Finance and Paragon. The Defendants 

produced no documentation to the Plaintiffs that a credible and proper sole source determination 

was made or even considered for the new or additional and different services described in the 

2008 and 2009 Contracts. 

 39. According to the description of the work to be performed under the Subject 

Contract (the second “amendment”), “Paragon is prepared to offer assistance in several areas of 

the FRMS Upgrade project during Fiscal Year 2010…. The exact tasks will be agreed upon 

jointly by the State and Paragon during the FRMS Upgrade project” (see Exhibit 1 at p. 5). If the 

tasks to be performed under the second contract amendment were to be “agreed upon jointly by 

the State and Paragon during the FRMS Upgrade project” (emphasis added) rather than before 

the contract was entered into, it is illogical that the Defendants or anyone else could make the 

determination that Paragon was the only “business entity [that could] provide the required goods 

or service” (see § 41-16-71(3)) prior to defining what specific service(s) Paragon was offering to 

perform under the contract. Rather, the Defendants are trying to commit to paying Paragon an 

additional $12.9 million dollars of tax payers’ money for work that is not even defined, that may 

not be necessary, that may be for a service that another contractor could provide, that Paragon is 

incapable of providing within its own organization, and that Paragon intends to farm out to 

various and questionable individuals and entities through a series of secret no-bid subcontracts 

that Paragon refuses to provide to the Committee. 

B.  The Subject Contract is in clear conflict with the legislative intent behind 
Alabama’s Competitive Bid Law. 

40. Alabama law is clear on the legislative intent behind the State’s competitive bid 

law. “The Legislature finds and declares that the best interests of the taxpayers of Alabama 
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are served when competition exists in the procurement of goods and services by state 

departments, boards, commissions, authorities, and instrumentalities of state government. 

Competitive bid requirements ensure that all citizens have the opportunity to compete for 

government procurements and it is imperative that officials charged with expending public 

funds conduct competitive processes which are open to all interested and qualified persons 

and businesses. In order to ensure fair and open competition in the procurement of goods and 

services, this article shall be liberally construed.” § 41-16-70 of the Code of Alabama (emphasis 

added).  

41. It is undisputable that the Subject Contract, as well as the 2007 and 2008 

Contracts, were not the result of any competitive process and none of those contracts were open 

to any other potential interested and qualified persons or businesses. Therefore, the Subject 

Contract is contrary to Alabama public policy, and the Plaintiffs are not satisfied that the Subject 

Contract is in the best interests of the taxpayers of Alabama. The evidence produced to the 

Committee supports a conclusion that the 2007, 2008, and 2009 Contracts were all entered into 

in violation of Alabama’s Competitive Bid Laws and are void as a matter of law. 

PRAYER FOR RELIEF

WHEREFORE, PREMISES CONSIDERED, the Plaintiff respectfully demands that 

this Honorable Court issue an order that provides the following relief:  

A.  Preliminarily enjoining the Defendants from executing and performing any 

obligations under the Subject Contract,  the proposed Amendment to Contract Number 010-

C8010008, until such time as the Plaintiffs have had a reasonable and meaningful opportunity to 

thoroughly review and comment on the Subject Contract pursuant to their statutory duty. 
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B. After the Plaintiffs have had a reasonable and meaningful opportunity to 

thoroughly review and comment on the Subject Contract pursuant to their statutory duty, 

Plaintiffs request that this Honorable Court designate a time and date for a hearing for the 

purposes of declaring the Subject Contract in violation of Alabama’s Competitive Bid Law and 

thus void as a matter of law, and permanently enjoining the Defendants from executing and 

performing any obligations under the Subject Contract. 

C. Granting the Plaintiff such other and further relief that is just and appropriate 

under the circumstances. 

Respectfully submitted, 

                                             _/s/  Tyrone C. M Means________
TYRONE C. MEANS (MEA003) 
H. LEWIS GILLIS (GIL011) 
CHRISTOPHER S. GENEREUX (GEN009) 
ROSLYN CREWS (CRE013) 
GERALD C. BROOKS (BRO212) 
Attorneys for the Plaintiffs 

OF COUNSEL: 

Tyrone C. Means, Esq. [tcmeans@tmgslaw.com] 
H. Lewis Gillis, Esq. [hlgillis@tmgslaw.com] 
Gerald C. Brooks, Esq. [gcbrooks@tmgslaw.com] 
THOMAS, MEANS, GILLIS  & SEAY, P.C. 
3121 Zelda Court  
Post Office Drawer 5058 
Montgomery, Alabama 36103-5058 
Phone: (334) 270-1033 / Facsimile: (334) 260-9396 

Christopher S. Genereux, Esq. [csgenereux@tmgslaw.com] 
Roslyn Crews, Esq. [rccrews@tmgslaw.com]   
THOMAS, MEANS, GILLIS  & SEAY, P.C.
505 20th Street North, Suite 400 
Post Office Box 11365 
Birmingham, Alabama 35202-1365 
Phone: (205) 328-7915 / Facsimile: (205) 214-6160  
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